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Buffalo, NY Wendel, a nationally recognized design, construction and energy services company, has
acquired The Architecture Group (TAG), a firm specializing in institutional architecture in Atlanta and
the Southeast, to enhance its offering to include additional transportation, educational and
infrastructure expertise in the area. Two of their main clients are MARTA (the Metropolitan Atlanta
Rapid Transit Authority) and the University System of Georgia 

“We are truly excited about the growth Wendel is experiencing nationwide,” said Stewart Haney,
president and CEO.

Wendel and The Architecture Group share a common purpose and passion for designing transit
facilities, higher education and water infrastructure facilities and are in complete alignment in terms
of their service to clients, project types and experience, and most importantly, corporate culture.
TAG’s current clients in the Atlanta area will also benefit from their newly extended professional
resources and advanced technology; especially the addition of engineering and construction
professionals in house that will give projects the opportunity to be managed by a simpler team.  

“It is an exceptional opportunity for The Architecture Group to join Wendel, a company of like vision,
philosophy and culture. It offers TAG the ability to frame our future in the larger context of the AEC
industry throughout southeast. The continued growth we are experiencing in Atlanta and the region
requires greater expertise and expanded resources.  It also requires the simple desire to serve
clients in the best way possible, a TAG philosophy since its inception.  As in the past, and today as
part of Wendel, we plan to do just that,” said Bobbie Unger, TAG 

Atlanta is seeing tremendous growth. Many corporations are establishing major hubs in Atlanta and
existing organization are expanding their presence.  Their employees are choosing to live in the
urban core creating major revitalization developments.  This growth presents a great opportunity for
Wendel to expand its national presence. 

“Acquiring The Architecture Group increases our capabilities in the strategic areas that align with our
current and future growth plans. TAG greatly complements Wendel—we are able to provide our
clients a greater depth of services by uniting the two,” Haney said.  

Wendel is a nationally recognized design, construction and energy services company (ESCO),
providing services to clients across the country, including architecture; interior design; civil,
electrical, energy efficiency, environmental, mechanical, municipal, structural, and transportation



engineering; construction management; energy management; alternative fuels; commissioning; GIS;
landscape architecture; land-use planning; and survey. The firm is headquartered in Buffalo, NY with
offices in New York Metro; Rochester, NY; Syracuse, NY; Albany, NY; Minneapolis, MN; Eau Claire,
WI; Phoenix, AZ; Richmond, VA; Clarksburg, WV; Columbus, OH; Meriden, CT and Washington, DC
areas.
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